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E Proc Application — Reverse Auction Process
Vendor Manual — Version 2.2
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Steps for participating in Reversa Auction

Fovtal activite:
1. Click on R, fuc Bocament urder Downboad,
2. Save the downltaded Reverse Aucton document.

Offline activity:
3. Gpen Sioning utiity.
£, Seloct appropriate sgning certificate, browse the saved Reverse Auction dacument and select Sign Dorument.

5. Click on =ign documant.
Eartal activite;

& Click on Signad Aev.iue documant Lnder pload.

7. Srovese the signod document and uglood.

8. Click on Rarticipate in selected Reverse Auctions,

Click Herg to download Reverse Auction Help Mamal

Tender feverse AUCEn row background changes to gray color on successful uploading of signed Reverse Auction Document.

Bidders should select appropriate tender and click on "Participate in Selected Reverse Auctions"

button. On selecting the participation button, reverse auction screen will be displayed.

The following sections describe the screens which are displayed for Non-SOR (non-Schedule of
rates) and SOR (Schedule of rates) tenders respectively.

3.2 Screen for Non-SOR Tenders (Tenders not having schedule of rates)

Upon selecting a Non-SOR tender (Tenders not having schedule of rates) for participating in the
bidding process, the following screen is displayed.
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< | Fondiere ;&((gfmyy
r “ 1) Tenders and Contracis
— e
— S
, Welcome 24989998-Durmm y Supplier fur foading charges o Reverse Auction 10-Feb-2017 14:45:58
= Home
o ere ABctien Terders 16000014 HE- 10607 | Dezc.iSchedule A End Tim=; 10-Feb-2017 15:10
S aTE |Select | Previous Bid Currant Landsd Cazt B e Leading id i g Line Detais Histary
~ |
> Help =
< 1915363.28 1915363.28 o 1915363.28 m m
* LOGOUT
w |
S ke e |

Reverse Auction currency INR.
Tf the SUBMIT QUOTE button is not enabled after a few secomds of clicking, please RE-LOGIN to the page.

Yallow color background indicates the due date and time of the respective Reverse Auction is over.

Field descriptions in Non-SOR Screen: The following fields are available in Non-SOR screen

e Previous Bid: At the start of the Reverse Auction this field will display Bidder’s original quote
given in Price bid. However, during the Reverse Auction, this field will show the previous quote
submitted by bidder.

e Current Landed Cost: Bench Mark Price will be shown for first bid and thereafter latest bid as

received by HPCL for successive bids.

o Increment/ Decrement Landed Cost by << 0.00 % >>: This field shows Reverse Auction

decrement percentage or decrement amount as pre-set by HPCL. In the above example bidders
can decrease the rate by 0.5%.

¢ Upward-downward arrows are for arriving at proposed rate: Bidders can arrive at the proposed

amount by clicking the upward and downward arrow. No bid is submitted at this stage. Bidders
can increase the rate for arithmetic comparison but cannot submit the quote. In case the bidder
tries to submit an increased quote the following error message will be displayed.

Message from webpage

l . Your quote cannot be same or greater than existing minimum value
i,

e Leading Bid: At the start of RA process, this field will show the Bench Mark Price. Subsequently
while auction is in progress, this field will show latest minimum quote submitted by the
participating bidders.
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Submit Current Quote: This field has a Blue coloured button labelled as “Submit Quote”. This
button is to be used by the bidder for actually submitting the revised quote. Bidder should

remember to click on the corresponding radio button before click on “Submit”.

e Line Details: The Line details field has a blue button labelled as “Show” button. If bidder clicks
on “show” button a popup screen is displayed. Bidders should click on the “Show” button to
check individual item rates against a proposed amount, which has been arrived at by clicking
“upward/downward arrow”. No bid is submitted by clicking “Show” button. In the popup screen
bidder should click on “Calculate line wise values as per current landed cost” button to see
detailed calculations for each of his decrement quotes.

15000047 -HB 43002 :: Noa SOR

Calentnte Line wise values as per carrent Landed cost Mat do column values mean

Packing and Forw rding:2%

sup, fx of AC an (Base Value) , VAT5%6 on

oty 155 INR 20,1726 (e valun AP ity and - | 272:00 334875 002 15,73
Forwarding)
Packing and F orwm rding:2%
WS truss
- = on (Base Value] , VAT on - - ,
cantflevercar 100 INR 11.2258 e e d fietea Rt LS S603.57 n.02 V80744
shed Forwarding)
Packing and Forwardingite
S truss ; on (Base Value) , VATSoon : T
il T 07483 (Bane valur shacking ami | 16563 02413 0.02 218441
Forwarding)
Packing and Forwnring:2%
EUHOCUN TILE
WALKWAY HLT 170 INR 46,7040 oo (Bade Unlue) . VATSO o8 |y gy o5 843143 0.02 m501.07
e {Bake Value sPacking and

Forwarding)

Packing and Forvardingrate
on (Base Value) , VATS5% on
[Dane Value-+Rac king and
Forwarding

Eurocon Tike 173 R BR.I043 [Py DO, TH w02 1OUDEEE

e History: The History field has a blue button labelled as “Submissions”. Clicking on the
“Submissions” button shows details of quotes submitted by the bidder with date and time.

Bidders Price bid quote is also visible in submissions.

Your Submission History from Start Time:30/04/2015 20:05

Reverse Auction logout: This button is useful for screen logout.

Digital clock: Digital clock displays server time.

30/04/2015 20:58:
30/04/2015 20:50:
30/04/2015 20:49:
30/04/2015 20:41:
30/04/2015 20:34:
24/04/2015 11:54:
24/04/2015 11:54:
24/04/2015 11:54:
24/04/2015 11:54:
24/04/2015 11:54:
24/04/2015 11:51:
24/04/2015 11:51:
24/04/2015 11:50:
24/04/2015 11:50:
24/04/2015 11:50:
24/04/2015 11:50:
24/04/2015 11:49:
Price Bid Quote --- 19124.63

56,356 --- 12727.6

17.458 --- 12792.87
59,270 --- 12858.14
21,231 --- 12923.41
17.556 --- 12988.68
53.418 --- 14285.45
34.011 --- 14367.55
30,292 --- 14449.65
22,089 --- 14531.75
17,995 --- 14613.85
22.643 --- 14778.05
16.174 --- 14860.15
20,484 --- 15024.35
10.562 --- 15106.45
07.233 --- 15188.55
01.45Z --- 15270.65
34.763 --- 15352.75
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3.3 Screen for Schedule of rates Tenders
Upon selecting a SOR tender for participating in the bidding process, the following screen is displayed.

Field descriptions in SOR Screen: The following fields are available in SOR screen:

== fregFa dgifaaw ity Ahes
"m““ Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Limited A Globaf Fortung: 500 Company

.A! ; Tenders and Contracts
S

Welcome 24999998 Dummy Supplier for loading charges to Reverse Auction 07-Feb-2017 15:4%:31
* Home
s Reverse Auction Tendar: 160000 16-HE- 10807 DeacsSchedule A P e e
> RA Winer Doc e £ el Currant Daviating % ,,"‘;i:g‘,;":_?;:':;‘;':; Leading Bid mi‘f_&“c“‘:m Lina Dataile History

A
» Help - A :
O a0rson | 1067494 0 o - -

¥ LOGOUT

v |

Reverse Auction Screen Logool |

Reverse Auction currency INR.
Ii the SUBMIT QUOTE button is not enabled after a few seconds of clicking, please RE-LOGIN to the page.

Yellow color background indicates the due date and time of the respective Reverse Auction is over.

e Previous Bid: At the start of the Reverse Auction this field will display Bidder’s original quote
given in Price bid. However, during the Reverse Auction, this field will show the previous quote
submitted by bidder.

e Current deviating %: Bench Mark Price will be shown here in the initial screen and latest bid

received by HPCL for successive bids.
e Increment/ Decrement Deviating % by << 0.00 % >>: This field shows Reverse Auction

decrement percentage pre-set by HPCL. In the above example bidders can decrease the rate by
0.5%.
e Upward-downward arrows are for arriving at proposed rate: Bidders can arrive at the proposed

amount by clicking the upward and downward arrow. No bid is submitted at this stage. Bidders
can increase the rate for arithmetic comparison but cannot submit the quote. In case the bidder
tries to submit an increased quote the following error message will be displayed.

Message from webpage

l i Your quete cannet be same or greater than existing minimurm value

e Submit Current Quote: This field has a Blue coloured button labelled as “Submit Quote”. This

button is to be used by the bidder for submitting the actual RA quote.
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Leading Bid: This is the latest minimum submitted quote while Reverse Auction is in progress.
At the start of Reverse Auction, leading bid is the Bench Mark Price.

The leading bid is displayed as a percentage of SOR rate. In the above example screen shot, the
leading bid is 61.54% of SOR rates which is 38.46% less than SOR rate. If the leading bid is above
SOR rate it will be displayed as 100+ percentage ie. a leading bid which is 5.5% above SOR would
be displayed as 105.50.

e Line Details: The Line details field has a blue button labelled as “Show” button. If bidder clicks
on “show” button a popup screen is displayed. Bidders should click on the “Show” button to
check individual item rates against a proposed amount, which has been arrived at by clicking
“upward/downward arrow”. No bid is submitted by clicking “Show” button. In the popup screen
bidder should click on “Calculate line wise values as per current dev %” button to see detailed

calculations for each decrement.

HB-10807 =: A

| Caloulale Line wise values as per current Dewv % I Whal do column valines imean

Deviating Loading Facton ¢ o R Taxes & Extras: Packing and Forwarding:3.1% on (Base Value) , Loading Charges-Local:2.4% on (Base
s 06363 0,005 Z Value+Packing and Forwarding)

escription | MPCLrate | @idderrate | faxValue | MeMPostlax | landedCost |
Excavation for 1 e . 2 - 5
Foundation puoa 957 2711 UL BG5S 956216 GG A5
COLUMNS/BEAMS |0 o it 11.8144 22375 27481
L I

Columns Description | Go 1o Tep

567
I ngainst sach of the item, is derved after reducing the actusl taxes guoted by the vendor, for that iten. Eg, if the Tax applicable for this jtem i
o would ba Rs 42297,

6. vou can abso try
by clicking SUbMIt buttan.

e History: The History field has a blue button labelled as “Submissions”. Clicking on the
“Submissions” button shows details of quotes submitted by the bidder with date and time.

Bidders Priced bid quote is also visible in submissions.

Welcome 24990008 Dummy Supplier for loading charges to Reverse Auction 07-Feh-2017 15:56:03
» Home
5 Reverse AUChon Tender: 160000 16-HB- LOBOS Desc.:Schedule A Extended End Time :07-Feb-2017 16:05
S RAWeee T Select | Frevious B Current Deviating % ;:ﬁ;ﬂfqﬁ"jﬁ_’;‘g";_ L=ading Bid mi‘ﬂzm Line Details Histary
-~
» Help = = -
® w5991 1053004 o | s [
¥ LOGOAIT i

v

ission History from Start Time:07 /02/2017 15:00

07/02/2017 153
Frice Bid Quete —

Roversa Auction Screon Logoul |

Reverse Auction currency INR,
—
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3.4 Screen for Multi-currency Tenders:

Upon selecting a Non-SOR Global tender (with multi currencies) for participating in the Reverse
auction bidding process, the following screen is displayed. Bench Mark shall be in INR currency
only.

Field descriptions are as shown in section 3.2.

Tender:16000062-HB-10807 Desc: TEST TENDER | End Time:28-Jul-2016 13:15
: 2 Increment/Decrement 5 3 Submit g 7 5
Select | Previous Bid Current Landed Cost Landed Cost by 0.5 % Leading Bid COTTROL GaoEe Line Details History

S
9754352.9 92844 0 92844 m
~]

Reverse Auction Screen Logout C

Reverse Auction currency INR.
If the SUBMIT QUOTE button is not enabled after a few seconds of clicking, please RE-LOGIN to the page.

Yellow color background indicates the due date and time of the respective Reverse Auction is over.

o Leading Bid: This field will show the Bench Mark Price in INR currency. Bidders are requested to

submit reduce rates in INR only.

1600063-HB-L0807 :: TEST TENDER

| Cilculate Ling wise valuss as per ciirrent Lapded cost | What do column values mean
I TS T T
UNDER REAMED PILES RCC 234 USD 15653 Loading Charges-Locabd% on (Base Yalae] 24.20 629,16 629,16
ERICK MASCHRY WORKS 1200  USD 15501 Loading Charges-Locakd% on (Base Yalse] 134.42 323480 i 323480

Columns Description | Go 1o Top

lTha valse given in the Landad cost feld against eachof the item & the prsegted redyction in rate coresponding to reduiced value | decrement entared by yor intha man screen, Eg) if the qusted vilue of fabowas Rs 30 Labhs, and
urrmnt dacreiant valus b B 40 lakie, than (e fabeof o perticoler ftem, whick was qeoted by you an Ko 506 - wll now refec o fis 408/ -

0. That valie i i the Nath Post Tax flakd sgaist ach ol the iam, 1s daevel sfter redcing the sctial loabing factor spplied Toe that i, i il Vo laading fackar for the Rasm is 29, Uhen the vabis displived woull be Ri 392,18/,
B, the cale grven im the T3 VAl Fiebl ayaims sach ol the ibem in cumulative tas amount sddded on i the haskc .

H.The valus gven o Lhe Bidder rabe fisld agamad aach of the Eom, & dorived alter rdiecng bhe actul Lites quebed by he vindor, lor Uhak e, Eg: f tha Tas apphoable for his am b Sorvics Las of 105 Ui (e rabe dopleyod wil
e fu 137201,

. While eatonng decremant, durmg reverss suctisn protess, yau may specihicaly mier to the Bidder rate to make a reabstic asiimation of whatbar tho decrement submitted by you s workable rata,

B Vi it b by it il et b aid chick out the valn syabiat thie fiadd (Bidder rabie), lsfoss comviitting thi decremint vahi by cheking Submib bttas,

e Line Details: If bidder clicks on “show” button a popup screen is displayed. Bidders can view
individual item rates against an intermediate decrement, (arrived at by clicking
“upward/downward arrow”). No bid is submitted by clicking “Show” button. In the popup screen
bidder should click on “Calculate line wise values as per current landed cost” button to see

detailed calculations for each of his decrement quotes.
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For multi-currency tenders, currency exchange rate shall be visible in show screen. This currency
exchange rate shall be of unpriced bid opening date. Basic rates are displayed in original
currency. For every decrement in INR, corresponding item rates are visible in original currency.

e In case rates for certain lines are quoted in INR, the currency exchange rate shall be displayed as

1 (one).
160000461 -HB-10807 :: TEST TENDER
| Calcisate Line wise vabins as per corment Landed oost ] Wit e colunn values moan

e — Packing and Forwarding:5% o (Base Valee ) , Loading
OUNDATION EETI ) ] (REIC) :Mm:;'_l.u;nliqﬂh an (Nase Value+ Packing and 2804 annr 0.02 SRS
arwarding
NOCR REAMED Packing and Formardingz5% on (Nase Valee) , Loading
1200 GRP [0.21 LA20% Charges-Localid% on (Base Valoe Packing and 124,600 147034 a.02 15406.03
FILES ROC oty

wnd

Lol reder ut matmend dry o in (S musie sorsen, Egiif Ehe guabed vake of job e i 50 Gk

Thes vskos

s Bihel
= Tasicd (Biddor ratn), beior

4 Procedure for Submission of new reduced bid

Reverse auction shall be held for a period of 60 minutes. The auction process automatically gets extended
by a further period of 5 minutes in case of receipt of any fresh bid during the last 5 minutes of the auction
period. This process will continue until no bids are received in the last 5 minutes of the auction. Thereafter

reverse auction shall get automatically closed.

During the bidding process, Bidders should use the increment/Decrement arrow keys to revise their bids.
After the decrement is done, bidders should press the “SUBMIT” button to submit the fresh bid.

Upon submission of fresh bid, the bidder will be able to see his fresh bid in “Previous Bid” field.

4.1 Benchmark price calculation

As per the latest Reverse auction terms and condition, the benchmark price shall be the lowest of the
prices quoted by techno-commercially accepted vendor’s bids vis-a-vis HPCL estimated rates. The
benchmark price is discreetly calculated by system without revealing the vendors identity.

Please note -

&= During the entire bidding process, the bidder’s identity vis-a-vis quoted price shall be

confidential.
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& If a competitor submits a fresh reduced bid, the field “Leading Bid” for SOR or Non-SOR
tenders will show the latest bid. This happens instantaneously and would be visible to all

bidders on their screens.

&= |t may be noted that if two bidders submit the quote almost at the same time, the system will
consider the bidders rate/quote which hits the system first. This time difference is logged till
the mille second. In such a scenario, the system will send the following message to the second

bidder cautioning him that the bid submitted is not the lowest bid.

U o ) e T e Toveverse RUTion T ey 2010 TN 1500

Snd Time-31-Dec-2016 23:59

Tander: 15000022-HC- 10003

Une Datais Hamoy

Soloct| Previeus 81 Curene Landed Cast By 36 e .
® | 5915033 59100.33 0 EOTT RN sobmt Quote I ow [ Sebrissions |
The Value Quoted by you is not Minimum value 1
1f the SUBMI| m

Yellow color background indicates the due date and time of the respective Reverse Auction is over.
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5 Reverse Auction Closure

As explained in section 3 above, the RA process will continue until no bids are received in the last 5
minutes of the basic auction period (60 mins) or extended auction period.

If no bid is received in the last 5 minute period, reverse auction shall get automatically closed. The
moment RA is completed, colour of auction line changes to ‘yellow’ and submit button will be disabled.
This indicates the closure of Reverse Auction.

N e gy

‘ ! Tenders and Contracts
S

Welcome 24 8-Dumimy Supp ling charges to Reverse Auction 07-Feb-2017 16:00:18|
* Home

» Reverse Auction Tender: 16000016-HB-10807 Deoc.:Schedule A Extended End Time :07-Feb-2017 16:05

| : ; = Increment/Dccrement T SUbmA ; z ;
+ RA Wianer DoC Select | Previous Bid Current Deviating %o Deviating ¥ by 0,25 % Leading Bid ATy line Details History

£3
+ Help b — —
© 1053004 | 1053994 0 1052004 | | NETETEEN | IEZE

s LOGOUT

v
Your Submission History from Start Time:07/02/20 5:00
058 --- 105.3994

1—-105.6693%
-~ 105.9394

0 --- 106.2094
107/02/2017 15:57:17.524 -- 106.4794
Price Bid Quote --- 107.5594

6 Refreshing of screen

Bidders can refresh the screen by clicking on ‘Reverse Auction’ menu option in left pane, select the
appropriate tender and click on participate in reverse auction button.
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7 RA winner document

After completion of Reverse Auction, Lowest bidder will get an email intimation to download

and submit the RA winner document.

Vendor can download the ‘RA winner document’ by to clicking on the “Generate Browse &

submit Winner Document” button available in “RA Winner Document” menu option as shown

below.

Vi Satres Toves

[ gy et ataitwa fatres
| @, | Hindaston Petrolewum Corporaton Limvted
e

Tenders and Contracts

The successful bidder should -

Select tender and click on ‘Generate selected Tender Document’.
Save the document and sign it using signing utility.

Select the signed document by browsing

Submit signed Reverse Auction document.

Bidder can save the following confirmation message generated by system for records.

| Viewr Server Time

| fiegwaa dgifaus sivwa fafes

@ Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Limited A Globul Fortune 500 Company
Poedisre Aoll /uyy
Al Tenders and Contracts
=

SITE 1S FOR TESTING AND DEVELOPMENT ONLY. NO LIVE TRANSACTION/BIDDING SHALL BE DONE ON THIS SITE.
r Code & Name : 20009191 - Lakshmi Kumaran & Sridharan

+ Home Your signed ent ninner docurment of Misce Jtems for tender :14000011-HR-11211 held from 20/02/2015 15:00 t 20/02,/2015 16:00
h ly submined Please «eep this hash 7457 180096051 62a7679b9a8 256170 a5 confirmation of your submssion,
» Choase Tender
Print Details
* Prepare fid

+ Quenes B Messpges

Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Ltd
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8 Multiple Reverse Auctions

If a bidder wishes to participate in more than one RA at the same time, bidder should select all tenders and
download and enter passwords for each selected tenders and click on ‘participate in selected Reverse
Actions’ button.

&= Please note a bidder can participate in upto 5 Reverse Auctions on the same screen at a time. Also,
passwords are different for each of the different Reverse auction on same or different tenders.

View Server Time

el R dglfasr siovaa ffks

@ Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Limited A Global Fortane 500 Comparry
~ | P Al of enerpy

Tenders and Contracts

Bidder Code & Name : 24999998 - Dummy Supplier for loading charges

3 Home
# Reverse Miction Roverse Auctions List
3 ‘R Winner Doc
.| TEWDER = TERLATIVE OC SRL. NO.
S LEC wumger  DESCRIFTION START TIME TE&“E DOWNLOAT UPLOAD £ VALID UPTD
5 LOGOUT 7] e A i i (S PETT g0y 35,05 Sned Docrmmnt i skmady varifind foe thin | 1356751554 20-4pe- 2018
7 PP —— L2007 ot o017 5920 Bned Document 1= akvendy vertfied for this :g?:;:‘lﬁ?‘-:“-\p'-lﬂlg
= 1600001 5-HE- 10807 Schudule & LFER0ET | gp e 1 Sioned Docunsent is alroady varified fur this | 1336731584-20-t0c-2018
= il |14:03 semsinn 045
) TED0001E-HE-L0BD7 Schadule & B:;’v?’:? P — :\gud Ducunsent is sirandy vecifind for s ﬁ;s\sm-nn-w-mxs

Gteps for participatmg in Heverse Auction

bt i
1, Dick o Rev.Aue. Documan: undir Download.
2. Save the devnlzaded Asverus Aursicn document

Welcome 24999998-Dummy Suppher for loading charges to Reverse Auction 10-Feb-2017 14:42:23
+ Home

 Reverse fuction HE-10807 [ oeciScheduled |

gt 5 Incramant/Dacremant Submic ]
R Select | Previous Bid | Current Deviatrg % mgﬂg i Leading Bid e i | Line Detzils :
o | Lj |
t3 P
1053994 | 105.3994 0 |
» LOGOLT
b e |

Tenden LGODD00E- HE- 10607 _Oesc.Schedule A

e __End Temea10-Feb-2017 15:05
Incremen:

Siemi

Sedect | Previos Bid Current Devioting % Mlﬁ“g”%m Leading Bid i oot Line Detals Hiztary
| 5616 55.64 0 55.64 St ot | e [ Stminsic= |
_2‘_]

B07

T = Tncraniony Becrams ; =@ ; = ;
Sebect | Prmvious Bid Currat Landed Coxt Liretad ot by 0 nR, | Lesding Bid e e Lin= Detsls Histary
o~

278722 278692 0 7so02 | TN | D =TS

o DescSchedule A I £nd Tima:10-Feb-2017 15:10
Tncram, remenc I Subimi =
Eslect|  Previous B Current Lanced Cost Vanided Cast by 15 % Leading Bid current quots Lie Oetnits: History:

-

1015363.28 | 1915363.28 0 101536328 | JEETE | B | E=E
|

Reverse Auchion Screes Logout.
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The procedure for participating in each of the multiple reverse auctions is same as that of participating in
a single reverse auction explained in various sections above.

e Scrolling Message on Upcoming RA: If one RA is in progress and another RA is going to start, the
eligible bidder will see a scrolling message ‘Upcoming Reverse Auction: .....Tender no..... start

time......” on the screen.

g;? Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Limited

7| Poetre ﬁ((q’n&yy

- Welcome 24999998 -Dummy Supplicr for loading charges to Reverse Auclion 10-Feb-2017 14:49:57
= Home
+ Reverse Auchion Tender: 160000 14-HB- 10607 nesc.:Schedule A Erd Turs: 10-Feb-2017 15:10
L e e ot T oere -

+ FA Winner Doc Select|  Previcus Bud Current Landed Cost Lanidad Cost by 0.3 % Leading Bid irvant itiata | Line Datzlls Histmry

Hal Al
+ Halp | 7 =

) | 1915363.28 | 1915363.28 0 1915363.20 EEE
= LOGOUT
w i

A Gigbal Forturie 500 Company

' Tenders and Contracts

Yellow color background indicates the due date and lime of the respective Reverse Auction is over,
Upcoming Reverss Auctions: Tender; 1300001 2-HB-10807(TEST TENDER FOR EPROC) Start Time: 10/ 02/2017 14:53

9 Postponement / Cancellation of Reverse Auctions

In case HPCL decides to postpone or Cancel a scheduled Reverse Auction, all eligible bidders will be informed

by suitable e-mails well in advance.

In case of RA Cancellation due to RA failure or any other reason, bidders will also be informed by email to
witness the price bids on the portal at scheduled date and time. A mail message will be received by eligible

bidders towards this.

10 RA extension

e In extreme case of Server outage, network outage or failure of Internet connectivity, (or any other
unforeseen conditions) from HPCL’s end, fax/ E-Mail communication shall have to be made
immediately, to concerned purchase officer of HPCL. No such request shall be entertained beyond
one hour of the RA closing time. To provide equal opportunity, HPCL may decide to extend the
Reverse auction at their discretion, but not as the right of the bidder. The vendors participating in
Reverse Auction process shall be kept on standby for 1 Hour after RA closing time.

Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Ltd

Page 24 of 27




E Proc Application — Reverse Auction Process
Vendor Manual — Version 2.2

. |1l

HPCL shall investigate the above matter and decision for extension of Reverse Auction shall be
based on the merit of the issues pointed out and verified by HPCL and same shall be final and
binding on the vendor.

e HPCL shall complete the investigation within two working days of receiving complaint from any of
the vendor.

e In case of decision to extend Reverse Auction, intimation mail may go out to all vendors within a
day of investigation closure. Vendors shall generally be given intimation, a day in advance before
extended Reverse Auction is commenced. The Reverse Auction shall commence from the last saved
decrement value and shall be open for period of original duration from commencement.

11 Reports:

Bidder can see ‘list of Reverse Auctions participated’ thru Reports.

By clicking on ‘Participated Reverse Auctions’ in Reports tab, Bidder can see tender number, tender
description, RA start date and End date , Closing Bid value and Bench Mark Price along with their own
submitted bids along with date and time.

Participated Reverse Auctions
= Home
START DATE END DATE CLOSING BID BENCHMARK
+ Prepare Bid :;ggﬂ“s'"B' Civil Jobs at Sewree Terminal ~ 00-Mar-2015 12:30 23;;‘;”2“15 332551.47 369501.6220
> Queres & Messages
e .- 09/03/2015 13:21:29.881 33255147
09/03/2015 13:21:21.662 339941.5
= Revised Price Bid 09/03/2015 13:21:16.8%6 34733153
) 09/03/2015 13:17:27.579 354721.56
B [ 09/03/2015 13:17:18.463 362111.59
= RA Winner Doc Price Bid Quote 36%301.62
+ Bids Rationalization :‘H'ﬂm"'"B' SOR tender 1 11-Mar-2015 14:30 t;;:‘;’“mls 03.2525 100.0025
e ——
11/03/2015 15:34:32.563 93,2525
» Witness Bid Opening 11/03/2015 15:33:22.588 93.5025
. ) 11/03/2015 15:32:52.371 93,7525
b BRI 11/03/2015 15:32:27.538 94,0025
» Utilities 11/03/2015 15:32:24.010 94,2525
11/03/2015 15:32:16.603 94,5025
= Reports 11/03/2015 15:32:10.181 94,7525
+ Help 11/03/2015 15:31:51.837 95,0025
11/03/2015 15:31:36.586 95,2525
= LOGOUT 11/03/2015 15:31:28.711 95,5025
11/03/2015 15:31:24.655 95,7525
11/03/2015 15:30:48.818 96,0025
11/03/2015 15:30:40.115 96,2525
11/03/2015 15:30:37.662 96,5025
11/03/2015 15:30:34.849 96,7525
11/03/2015 15:30:31.161 97,0025
11/03/2015 15:30:28.583 97,2525
11/03/2015 15:30:23.270 37,5025
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12 Email Messages to Bidders
[l eligible bidders will be getting e-mails pertaining to Reverse Auctions from time to time. A list of such e-
mails is given below —

° Email Regarding witnessing of loading factors

Evaluation has been completed for Tender/Schedules/Lines: 10-02-2016 16:36:25 in the system. Please
login to the site https://etender.hpcl.co.in and click Witness bid opening tab to witness loading factor
if any against above tender. Note: This is system Generated Mail. Pls do not reply to this email.

° Mail Regarding Reverse Auction date & Time (including Loading factors)

Reverse Auction has been called for a schedule of above tender. Please login to your account. Go to
reverse auction tab. Download RA Document. Sign it with the appropriate certificate and upload it
on the same page to proceed for participation in reverse auction.. RA Desc : Schedule A RA Date On:
18-05-2016 16:05:00. Please login to witness your Loading Factors before participating in Reverse
Auction on schedule date and time. You may refer the help manual available in portal to understand
the RA process.

Please ensure to login on the scheduled date and time to participate in the reverse auction. You
may also contact Helpdesk at 022-4114666 between 8.00 AM to 8.00 PM for any kind of support on
the RA process.

. Email regarding Reverse Auction Winner document:

Reverse Auction has been concluded for a schedule of above Tender. Tender Number: XXXXXXXXX
, RA No:356 ,RA Desc: SCHEDULED A ,RA Date:26-MAR-2015:12:00 You are the lowest bidder on
the recently concluded RA against subject tender. Please click on RA winner doc tab and submit
the digitally signed RA winner document, generated from system as a token of confirmation to
the final rate submitted by you. HPCL reserves the right to further negotiate the prices with lowest
bidder for reducing the price/cancel the reverse auction process/tender at any time before
ordering without assigning any reasons except in cases where tender is required to be cancelled
after opening of priced bid and identification of L1 vendor wherein reasons for cancellation are
to be conveyed to the L1 vendor.
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Email Regarding postponement of Reverse Auction

Reverse Auction for Tender No 15000017-HB-10807 - SOR TENDERS scheduled at 01-
May-2015 12:00 is postponed to 01-May-2015 15:00. Please ensure to login on the scheduled
date and time at 01-May-2015 15:00 to participate in the reverse auction event. RA slot is not
available

Email regarding Cancellation of Reverse Auction

Reverse Auction for Tender No 15000016-HB-10003 - Demo Tenders scheduled at 20-Apr-2015
15:45 is cancelled. Bid opening can be witnessed from 20-Apr-2015 16:00 onwards. RA is cancelled

Reverse Auction Extension Mail

Reverse Auction has been extended for a schedule of above tender scheduled at 22-Apr-2015 14:00
has been extended and new event time is 04-Feb-2016 15:00. We regret the inconvenience caused.
Please login to your account in http://etender.hpcl.co.in, Click on Reverse Auction tab and participate
in Reverse Auction with new decrypted password.
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SCOPE OF WORK

1 GENERAL SCOPE OF WORK

a.

Scope of work shall include but not limited to designing, planning, engineering,
procurement  (manufacturing/supply),  construction/  erection,  testing,
commissioning of 7 KW solar PV plant as a turnkey contract according to terms
and conditions set out herein. Turnkey EPC contract shall be in accordance with all
applicable regulations and permits so that the solar PV plant fulfills the requirement
by Project developer and the technical specifications as specifically mentioned under
this contract. The turnkey development of solar PV plant by the turnkey EPC

Contractor shall essentially include:

Basic project planning, sequencing and scheduling, solar resource assessment,
energy yield predictions for project life cycle, basic and detailed designing, project
component selection, preparing engineering and construction drawings, obtaining
permissions, and all other requirements as required for commissioning and

interconnecting the solar PV plant up to the HPCL Electrical Room.

Manufacturing, supply, sourcing, procurement, transportation of all solar PV plant
equipment’s, required insurance, electrical components, structural components, civil
engineering material, mechanical engineering components, earth moving
equipment’s, construction machinery and all other construction equipment’s as
required for development, implementation, construction, testing, commissioning

and interconnection to the applicable evacuation voltage level.

Arranging for water and electricity during construction, obtaining permits and
approvals from all local stakeholders, government statutory bodies, obtaining
permissions from electrical inspectorate, liaison with transmission utility for

evacuation infrastructure and commissioning of plant.

Site preparation ( Roof Top Cleaning ), providing construction infrastructure like
site office, internal roads, stores etc., assembly and construction of the entire solar
PV plant, all pre-construction tests, site management and supervision, labor

provision, testing and commissioning of all the equipment’s in steps and
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commissioning and interconnection of the utility scale solar PV plant to applicable

evacuation voltage level.

All the operations not expressly included, that are necessary for proper functioning
of the solar PV plant and fulfillment of the guaranteed performance, rules,
regulation, and applicable codes, being the meaning of necessarily all these things,
which are inherent to the Project and without which the solar PV plant would be

unable to start operating commercially.

Commissioning of the solar PV plant, 7 days performance Guarantee test, monthly

and yearly performance evaluations.

Training’s personnel for operation and maintenance, handing over the plant to

HPCL, provision of all the documentation necessary for the correct performance.
EVACUATION OF POWER & METERING POINT:

For the purpose of this project, the evacuation voltage shall be at 440 V AC (three phase)
wherein evacuating point cum metering point shall be installed at internal network grid of
the HPCL.

HPCL will provide one Spare 440 VV AC (three phase) point for integration of Solar Output
with the grid.

Solar Generation Meter shall be installed at 440 VV AC to measure generated energy from the
proposed solar PV power plant. The energy metering at HPCL station by DISCOM is at
440V level.

Bi Directional meter/s shall be installed at 440V interconnection point to measure import-
export of energy. Any additional requirement for check meter/s by DISCOM / TRANSCO
at any other voltage level will also be in the scope of the bidder. The metering scheme shall
be as per the norms of the utility and any change in the location of meter/s or any other
requirement of the utility shall be provided by the bidder without any additional cost

implication to HPCL.

Necessary Net Metering Agreement along with all other Liasoning and other formalities with
the DISCOM and any other statutory authority is under the scope of bidder.
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f. Any License fees on demand Note Raised by any statutory authority such as JDVVNL,
JVVNL, and RRECL will be paid by HPCL.

3. ELECTRICAL WORK
Consisting of installation of solar PV modules, junction boxes, grid-tied string inverters,
meters, control panel, switchgear for evacuation, interconnection through wires, cables, bus

bars, etc.; plant and human safety and protection equipment including danger signs etc.
4. CIVIL AND OTHER NON-ELECTRICAL WORK

e Module Mounting Structures (MMS):Successful Contractor shall design,

fabrication, supply and install module mounting structures with all required
accessories like clamps, nuts, bolts, cable ties etc.; only 1-Axis manual seasonal type
structures can be accepted OR The structures can be of only seasonal are accepted;

e Foundations: Successful Contractor shall design and construct appropriate civil

foundations for Module Mounting Structures, inverters, etc.

e Cable Trenches: Construction of RCC cable trenches with cable trays and chequered

plate covers in Electrical Room , earthen excavated cable trench with alternate layers
of sand and brick as per relevant IS from PV arrays to Electrical room to Evacuation

& up to Take over point shall be provided by the Contractor.

e Cable Trays : Cable Trays to be provided for laying of cables from Solar PV Panel
to Inverter , Electrical Room to Inverter etc. The inverter shall beinstalled in the
telecom room and necessary cabling from telecom room to electrical room and

telecom room to roof to be done through cable trays

5. ROOF TOP CLEANING
The Contractor shall clear the site, as required, so as to compact the plant in minimum
possible area and also minimize shading losses because of solar PV module structures.The
Drawing of the Roof top denoting the area of Roof Top as sample has been attached (
ANNEXURE A)

6. STATUTORY REQUIREMENTS:
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All construction, operation and maintenance procedures shall be carried out through
appropriate relevant standards, regulations laid by JVVNL/JDVVNL/RRECL/ CEI /
MNRE/ HPCL and/or any other agency as and when applicable. Further, this shall comply
with the applicable labor laws. The Bidder shall make themselves aware of such

requirements and shall not solely depend on the Company to avail full information.
7. PLANNING AND DESIGNING:

a. The Contractor shall plan and design for the electrical / mechanical / civil
requirements including but not limited to plant configuration, space optimization,
distance between rows of modules, sufficient passage for man-power movement in
the plant, mounting structures, cable routing, selection of equipment and items,

procurement plan etc. to enhance plant output.

b. The design of all civil foundations, R.C.C structures, buildings etc. will be carried
out considering appropriate seismic zone of the area. All appropriate loads, wind
velocity, seismic factors etc. will be considered as per the relevant IS Specifications
while designing any Civil/Mechanical/Electrical structure. Also, the environmental
conditions, , atmospheric effect, , rain water data, land profile, etc. will be considered
as per site condition and accordingly appropriate precautions, preventive measures
such as applications of the Epoxy to Underground concrete structure and application
of sufficient galvanization to steel structure will be taken while designing the
structures. RCC of appropriate grade will be adopted considering surrounding
weather and soil effect of site and as per the relevant 1.S standard specifications. The
concrete mix design of required strength shall be carried out in Govt. approved
laboratory and shall be submitted to client for approval.

c. The Contractor shall take into consideration all parameters like wind speed, seismic
zone, safety factor etc. for the purpose design and construction of civil foundations

for all civil work as per relevant IS codes.

d. The Contractor shall carryout Shadow Analysis at the site and accordingly design
strings and arrays layout considering optimal usage of space, material and labour.

e. All designs & drawings have to be developed based on the governing standards and
requirements of the project and keeping in mind basic design specifications.
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Company may approve minor deviations or suggest required modifications in the
same, which are meant for increasing plant performance without sacrificing quality

/ workmanship norms.

f. The technology offered shall be commercially established technology and at least
one Project based on this technology shall be satisfactorily operational for at least

one year in India.

g. The Company reserves right to modify the specifications at any state as per local site
conditions / requirements and EPC contractor shall comply with modification

without any extra cost and time.

8. APPROVAL OF DESIGNS / DRAWINGS:

a. The following procedure has to be followed for assessment and approval of designs,
specifications and drawings during the course of the project: The Contractor shall
submit to the Company the documents in hard copy and soft copy to both with proper
reference and drawing numbers. The respective documents for selection, supply,
installation, erection, commissioning of equipment/ structures have to be submitted
at least 15 days in advance to the planned start of the activity as per Contractor’s
project schedule. The Contractor shall submit documents as required for this project
according to his design and specifications. The Company / Consultant (on behalf of
the Company) will assess and approve the documents within 10 days of submission
of documents; and only after the approval the Contractor shall release the
documents on site for execution. The documents shall be revised by the Contractor
as per instructions /comments given by the Company / Consultant (on behalf of the
Company) if required, prior to execution. Subsequent revisions and the final version
of the documents shall also be submitted in hard and soft copy to the Company and
the Consultant. The Contractor has to take into account the above mentioned process
of revisions (if required) and adjust the preparation and delivery of the documents
such that the overall planned project schedule is not affected.

b. The Contractor has to submit all drawings, which are related to plant for approval

and the Contractor, shall not claim any drawing as their intellectual property.
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Drawing which is developed for project will be the intellectual property of the

Company.

c. The Bidder shall submit basic engineering drawings of all civil work, including but
not limited to, layout of the power plant indicating rows of photovoltaic modules,
basic MMS design, civil foundations, location of control panels, DC and AC
Distribution Boxes and anchoring design / details, electrical SLD, shading analysis
and generation estimation report etc. The maximum permitted line losses on the AC
Side is 3%.

d. The Contractor shall submit a comprehensive maintenance schedule for operation
and maintenance of the photovoltaic power plant along with checklists before
commencement of work on site and shall be liable for abiding by the schedule. All
construction, operation and maintenance procedures shall be carried out through

appropriate relevant standards, regulations and labor laws.

9. FINAL COMMISSIONING:
The commissioning procedure shall be as per HPCL / RRECL / JDVVNL / JVVNL /
MNRE/ Chief Electrical Inspector to Government (CEIG) requirements as applicable . The

Contractor shall also ensure the following:

a. Obtaining written certificate of commissioning of the facility and permission to
connect to the grid from the office of the Chief Electrical Inspector of the state and
any other authorized representative from Government of India (Gol)/ RRECL/
HPCL/ JDVVNL/JVVNLor any other agency .

b. Inspection and successful electrical commissioning certificate from the Company.

c. Obtaining all certificates required by Discom (JDVVNL/JVVNL) from agency
appointed by them.

d. Satisfactory completion certificate towards completion of all other contractual
obligations by the Contractor as stipulated from the Company.
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10. DETAILED SCOPE OF WORK IS AS BELOW:

o Vi Pym— Supplier/ | Purchaser/
EPC HPCL
A Approvals
All the documentation work related approval, clearance, P (HPCL will
. submission from various State or govt. or any other legal s provide only
authority ~ to  successful  implementation  and supporting
commissioning of the project. document)
B General Works
1 Transit insurance, Workmen compensation, S
2 Handling Local issues (if any) for EPC Scope of Work
3 Construction Power and Water
A Temporary storage, security and manpower basic s
amenities
5 Health, Safety and Environment Standards S
C Supply, Design, Installation, Testing & Commissioning
DC Part
1 Supply of Photovoltaic Module S
Unloading at site, storage, inter carting, shipping on
2 desired location from storage yard, Security and S
Installation of Photovoltaic Module
3 Responsibility of Disposal of PV cartoons and any S
packing material
Interconnecting Cables for PV Modules 4 sq. mm and 6
4 sg. mm as per design concept with supply of UV S
Resistance cable tie
5 MC4 connector and Y-Branch connector S
6 Cable Trench for DC Cable S
7 DC side Earth Pit (As per detailed engineering) S
8 PV Module Earthing S
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